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Laura Marchant

From: Karean Dwyer <Ktdwyer@pbcgov.org>
Sent: Thursday, June 3, 2021 12:42 PM
To: PermitLibrarian; Derrek Moore; Margarett Charles
Cc: Joel Hatcher
Subject: RE: 17120309/MU-2021-019513-0000

Good morning  Laura,

 

The plans for the subject MU have been stamped. The impact fees process is completed.

 

Karean

From: PermitLibrarian <permitlibrarian@wpb.org>

Sent: Wednesday, June 2, 2021 9:16 AM

To: Karean Dwyer <Ktdwyer@pbcgov.org>; Derrek Moore <DMoore@pbcgov.org>; Margarett Charles

<MCharles@pbcgov.org>

Cc: Joel Hatcher <jhatcher@wpbha.org>

Subject: RE: 17120309/MU‐2021‐019513‐0000

 

****** Note: This email was sent from a source external to Palm Beach County. Links or attachments should

not be accessed unless expected from a trusted source. *******

Good morning,

 

Do you all need anything from us to review this permit again for impact?

Laura Marchant

Plans Review Librarian

City of West Palm Beach

permitlibrarian@wpb.org

Tell us how we are doing?

https://www.surveymonkey.com/r/WestPalmBeachConstructionServices [surveymonkey.com]

From: Joel Hatcher <jhatcher@wpbha.org>

Sent: Tuesday, June 1, 2021 11:50 AM

To: PermitLibrarian <permitlibrarian@wpb.org>

Cc: 'Ktdwyer@pbcgov.org' <Ktdwyer@pbcgov.org>; Derrek Moore <DMoore@pbcgov.org>; 'Margarett Charles'

<MCharles@pbcgov.org>

Subject: FW: 17120309/MU‐2021‐019513‐000017120309

06/14/21

https://www.surveymonkey.com/r/WestPalmBeachConstructionServices
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Good morning,

 

There have been some impact fee Available Credits adjustments made to our Merry Place account. I do not have a clue

how this has to be done, but somehow permit #17120309/MU‐2021‐019513‐0000 needs to be re‐evaluated for impact

fees given the credit account was reimbursed credits and we should now not owe any on this permit. Please advise.

Thank you.

 

Joel Hatcher

Dir. Of Construction Services

Cell 561‐676‐8442 email jhatcher@wpbha.org

West Palm Beach Housing Authority

3700 Georgia Ave.

West Palm Beach, Fl 33405

Lic. CBC1258445  CFC050540

From: PermitLibrarian <permitlibrarian@wpb.org>

Sent: Wednesday, May 19, 2021 7:33 AM

To: Joel Hatcher <jhatcher@wpbha.org>

Subject: FW: 17120309/MU‐2021‐019513‐0000

See below email from Impact.

 

Laura Marchant

Plans Review Librarian

City of West Palm Beach

permitlibrarian@wpb.org

Tell us how we are doing?

https://www.surveymonkey.com/r/WestPalmBeachConstructionServices [gcc02.safelinks.protection.outlook.com]

From: Karean Dwyer <Ktdwyer@pbcgov.org>

Sent: Tuesday, May 18, 2021 6:52 PM

To: Laura Marchant <LEMarchant@wpb.org>; Carolina Carvajal <ccarvajal@wpb.org>

Cc: Derrek Moore <DMoore@pbcgov.org>; Margarett Charles <MCharles@pbcgov.org>; Willie Swoope

<WSwoope@pbcgov.org>

Subject: FW: 17120309/MU‐2021‐019513‐0000

Reference MU‐ 2021‐019513‐0000

 

Palm Beach County has completed an Impact Fee review and assessment of your building plans.  The plans are now

ready for impact fee payment.  Impact fees may be paid via the internet by visiting  www.pbcgov.com

[gcc01.safelinks.protection.outlook.com] [gcc01.safelinks.protection.outlook.com]
17120309

06/14/21

https://www.surveymonkey.com/r/WestPalmBeachConstructionServices
http://www.pbcgov.com
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[gcc02.safelinks.protection.outlook.com].  Click Departments and then Planning Zoning Building.  Go to Online Services

and then Online Payments.  See the drop‐down menu under “I want to pay” and click  Municipal Impact Fee.  Under

Tracking No, click the drop‐down menu for MU and record the rest of the MU number in the remaining boxes.  For

example MU 2021‐019513‐000, MU goes in the first box; 2021 in the second box; and, 019513 , in the third

box.  Leading/trailing zeroes (0) may be omitted.  Next click search and pay the fees with a credit card as instructed.

 

Fees may also be paid by cash, check or credit card by visiting Planning Zoning Building at 2300 N. Jog Rd, WPB.  If paying

by cash of check, simply visit the Cashiers Office located on the East side of the first floor lobby opposite the Security

Guard area.  If paying by credit card, visit the computer kiosk area on the West side of first floor lobby opposite the

Security Guard area.  The computers are already set for searching an MU.  Ask for assistance if you have problems.

 

Once you have paid the fees, send an email by hitting Reply All.  The email should simply indicate Impact Fees Paid – MU

2021‐019513 When this email is received, a digital Palm Beach County Impact Fee Stamp will be applied to your building

plans in ProjectDox.

 

Should you have questions, you may send a reply email or contact the Impact Fee Office at 561‐233‐5025.

 

Karean Dwyer

Building Permit Technician 111| Building Division

Palm Beach County Planning, Zoning & Building

2300 North Jog Road | West Palm Beach, FL 33411

Phone: (561) 233‐5139 |

ktdwyer@pbcgov.org

How did we do? Please let us know by visiting:

http://survey.pbcgov.com/s3/PZB‐Building [gcc01.safelinks.protection.outlook.com]

[gcc02.safelinks.protection.outlook.com]

 

Online Permit Application Information portal:

https://www.pbcgov.org/ePZB.Admin.WebSPA/#/Container/Permits_Inspections

[gcc02.safelinks.protection.outlook.com]

Electronic Permit Submittal Portal:

https://www.pbcgov.org/ePZB.Admin.WebSPA/#/login

[gcc02.safelinks.protection.outlook.com]

Permit Applications Checklist:

http://discover.pbcgov.org/pzb/building/PDF/permit_types.pdf

[gcc02.safelinks.protection.outlook.com]

Building Division Forms:

http://discover.pbcgov.org/pzb/building/Pages/Forms.aspx

[gcc02.safelinks.protection.outlook.com]

From: Margarett Charles <MCharles@pbcgov.org>

Sent: Friday, April 23, 2021 11:28 AM

To: Karean Dwyer <Ktdwyer@pbcgov.org>

Cc: Willie Swoope <WSwoope@pbcgov.org>; Derrek Moore <DMoore@pbcgov.org>

Subject: FW: 17120309
17120309

06/14/21

http://survey.pbcgov.com/s3/PZB‐Building [gcc01.safelinks.protection.outlook.com][gcc02.safelinks.protection.outlook.com]
http://survey.pbcgov.com/s3/PZB‐Building [gcc01.safelinks.protection.outlook.com][gcc02.safelinks.protection.outlook.com]
https://www.pbcgov.org/ePZB.Admin.WebSPA/#/Container/Permits_Inspections
https://www.pbcgov.org/ePZB.Admin.WebSPA/#/login
http://discover.pbcgov.org/pzb/building/PDF/permit_types.pdf
http://discover.pbcgov.org/pzb/building/Pages/Forms.aspx
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Good morning Karean,

 

Any update on permit below? Applicant called requesting update.

 

Thank you,

 

t̀ÜztÜxàà V{tÜÄxá
Financial Analyst II, Palm Beach County

Office of Financial Management & Budget

Impact Fee Office

2300 N. Jog Road, 2nd Floor

West Palm Beach, FL 33411‐2741

Office: (561) 233‐5025

Fax: (561) 656‐7965

Email: MCharles@pbcgov.org [gcc02.safelinks.protection.outlook.com]

 

From: Derrek Moore <DMoore@pbcgov.org>

Sent: Monday, April 5, 2021 9:35 AM

To: Karean Dwyer <Ktdwyer@pbcgov.org>

Cc: Gleiza Purdin <GPurdin@pbcgov.org>; Willie Swoope <WSwoope@pbcgov.org>; Margarett Charles

<MCharles@pbcgov.org>

Subject: FW: 17120309

Ms. Karean,

 

Please find the below fee estimate for your review and handling.

Thank you.

Derrek A. Moore
17120309

06/14/21
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Office of Financial Management & Budget

Impact Fee Office

2300 Jog Road

West Palm Beach FL 33411

561-233-5025
 

From: Laura Marchant <LEMarchant@wpb.org>

Sent: Wednesday, March 31, 2021 9:05 AM

To: Willie Swoope <WSwoope@pbcgov.org>

Cc: Derrek Moore <DMoore@pbcgov.org>; Margarett Charles <MCharles@pbcgov.org>; Carolina Carvajal

<ccarvajal@wpb.org>

Subject: 17120309

 

****** Note: This email was sent from a source external to Palm Beach County. Links or attachments should

not be accessed unless expected from a trusted source. ******
The above permit is ready to be reviewed for impact fees. The questionnaire has been uploaded.

 

Applicant Name:

Joel Hatcher

jhatcher@wpbha.org

 

Thank you!

 

Laura Marchant

Plans Review Librarian

City of West Palm Beach

 

Tel: 561‐805‐6658

Fax: 561‐805‐6676

lemarchant@wpb.org

Under Florida law, e-mail addresses are public records. If you do not want your e-mail address released in response to a
public records request, do not send electronic mail to this entity. Instead, contact this office by phone or in writing.

17120309

06/14/21


